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MINUTES  of an adjourned regular meeting of the City Council, City of Redlands, 

held in the Council Chambers, Safety Hall, 212 Brookside Avenue on 

January 30, 1973 at 4:00 P.M. 

ABSENT  

PRESENT  Charles C. DeMirjyn, Vice Mayor 
Ellsworth E. Miller, Councilman 
Sam S. Sewall, Councilman 

R. P. Merritt, Jr., City Manager 
Edward F. Taylor, City Attorney 
Peggy A. Moseley, City Clerk 
Erwin S. Hein, Redlands Daily Facts 
Chuck Palmer, San Bernardino Sun 

Jack B. Cummings, Mayor 
Chresten M. Knudsen, Councilman 

• 
This adjourned Council meeting was scheduled for the purpose of: 

(1) award of sale of $250,000 1962 Sewer Bonds; (2) award of con-

struction contracts for sewage treatment plant; (3) other business as 

required. 

BIDS  Bids for $250,000 "1962 Sewer Bonds, Series B" were opened and pub-

licly declared in the office of the City Clerk at 2:00 P.M. this date 

as previously advertised. 

Bank of America 
San Francisco, Calif. 

Bank of California 
Redlands, Calif. 

Premium 9.00 
Net Interest $60,991.00 
Cost 4.4357% 

Premium 0 
Net Interest $61,375.00 
Cost 4.4636% 
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BID TABULATTON FOR WASTEWATER TREATMENT 

Bid Item 

MODIFICATIONS 

1 	 2 

AND ADDITIONS, 

3 

DECEMBER 20, 1972 

Bidders 
6 *7 4 *5 

Base Bid, Schedule 	1 $4,600,000 3,445,000 to Did ;3,936,500 3,470,000 3,375,000 3,382,000 

Base Bid, Schedule 2 463,900 625,000 348,958 552,600 408,000 424,000 420,000 

Deduct Prig, 	(Award 

to 	ono 	contractor) 0 100,000 No Bid 100,000 5,000 13,500 

Total Base Bid 

(Schedule 1 plus 

Schedule 2 less 

Deduct) 5,063,900 3,970,000 No Rid 4,389,100 3,873,000 3,785,500 3,802,000 

Alter. Bid Item #1-Add 75,000 52,000 No Rid 56,000 51,000 51,000 54,000 

Alter. Bid Item #2-Add 125,000 93,000 No Bid 92,000 92,000 91,000 90,000 

Alter. Bid Item #3-Add 210,000 169,000 No Bid 174,000 166,000 154,000 161,000 

Alter. Bid Item #4-Add 15,000 19,000 11,300 29,500 12,500 15,000 16,000 

Alter. Bid Item 15 - 

Add or Deduct 29.00 19.39 45.00 28.00 17.00 27.00 21.00 

Alter. Bid 	Item 16 

Add or Deduct 27.00 18.00 44.00 27.00 16.00 26.00 20.00 

Alter. 	Bid 	Item #7 	- 

Add or Deduct 39.00 19.70 No Bid 41.00 29.00 40.00 28.00 

Alter. Bid Item 18-Deduct 6,000 5,000 No Bid 7,000 4,000 2,900 5,400 

Alter. Bid Item #9-Deduct 2,500 3,000 No Bid 4,500 3,400 2,700 3,000 

Alter. Bid Item #10-Deduct 4,000 10,000 No Bid 8,900 7,400 7,500 5,700 

Alter. Bid Item #11-Deduct 6,500 4,000 No Bid 9,200 6,400 5,800 7,500 

Alter. Bid Item #12-Deduct 134,000 85,000 No Bid 94,000 70,000 74,000 93,000 

0-0-0-0-0-0-0-0-0-0 
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