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MINUTES of an adjourned regular meeting of the City Council, City of Redlands,
held in the Council Chambers, Safety Hall, 212 Brookside Avenue on
January 30, 1973 at 4:00 P.M.

PRESENT Charles G. DeMirjyn, Vice Mayor

Ellsworth E. Miller, Councilman
Sam 8. Sewall, Councilman

R. P. Merritt, Jr., City Manager
Edward F. Taylor, City Attorney
Peggy A. Moseley, City Clerk

Erwin S. Hein, Redlands Daily Facts
Chuck Palmer, San Bernardino Sun

ABS ENT Jack B. Cummings, Mayor
Chresten M. Knudsen, Councilman
This adjourned Council meeting was scheduled for the purpose of:
(1) award of sale of $250,000 1962 Sewer Bonds; (2) award of con-
struction contracts for sewage treatment plant; (3) other business as

reqguired.

BIDS Bids for $250,000 "1962 Sewer Bonds, Series B" were opened and pub-
licly declared in the office of the City Clerk at 2:00 P.M. this date
as previously advertised. \

Bank of America Premium 8 9.00
San Francisco, Calif. Net Interest $60,991.00
Cost 4.4357%
Bank of California Premium $ 0
Redlands, Calif. Net Interest $61,375.00

Cost 4,4636%




BIDS (Continued)

Sewer
Bonds

Resolution
No. 3020

Bid Award

BIDS

Crocker National Bank
San Francisco, Calif.

First Western Bank
Los Angeles, Calif.

Security Pacific National Bank
Los Angeles, Calif.

United California Bank
Los Angeles, Calif.

United States National Bank
San Diego, Calif.

Weeden and Company
Los Angeles, Calif.

Wells Fargo Bank
San Francisco, Calif.

Each bid was accompanied by a good faith check in the amount of $5,000.
All bids were referred to a committee for checking and computation with

a report thereon to be given to Council at the 4:00 P.M. meeting.

At this time,

compute the bids that the bid of Weeden and Company is the bid yielding
the lowest net cost to the city:

After considering each of the bids and the report thereon, on motion

of Councilman Sewall,

3020, a resolution of the City Council of the City of Redlands awarding
$250,000 bonds of said city to the best bidder and rejecting all other

Premium
Net Interest
Cost

Premium
Net Interest
Cost

Premium
Net Interest
Cost

Premium
Net Interest
Cost

Premium
Net Interest
Cost

Premium
Net Interest
Cost

Premium

Net Interest
Cost

$59,350.00.

$ 3.25
$61,609.25
4.4806%

$ 0
$60,350.00
4.389%
$ 22.00
$60,853.00
4.42567%
$ 16.00
$60,759.00
4.418836%
$ 37.50
$61,412.00
4.46636%

0
$59,350.00
4.316%
$ 17.50
$62,107. 50
4.5169%

it is the report of the committee appointed to check and

seconded by Councilman Miller, Resolution No.

bids, was adopted by the following roll call vote:

AYES : Councilmen Miller,
NOES ¢ None
ABSENT:

At this time, Council thanked Mr. Ed Hyland of Stone and Youngberg
Municipal Financing Consultants, Inc. for his aSsiStaﬁce.
expressed satisfaction with the number and competitiveness of the bids
and stated that the low interest rate reflected the city's AA rating.

WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT

Bids on the modification and expansion of Redlands wastewater treatment
and disposal facilities were received and publicly opened in the office
of the City Clerk on December 20, 1972 at 10:00 A.M,
from seven contractors as indicated on the attached sheets. (See Page 371 & 372)

The bids were reviewed by the staff, referred to the consultant engineer

John Carollo and to the State Water Resources Control Board.

At this time, it is the recommendation of Utilities Superintendent,
Jack Shefchik, that following receipt of a grant increase from the En-
vironmental Protection Agency: recommendation of John Carollo Engineers;

and verbal approval of bid award from Leslie Delbon of the State Water

Sewall,

Councilman Knudsen, Mayor Cummings

Vice Mayor DeMirjyn

Resources Control Board; that award be made as follows:

Rids were received

Mr. Hyland




BIDS (Continued)

Bid Award

Sewer
Treatment
Facility

Grant Deeds

Stover and
Norman

Parking
Lot #3

Proposed
Escrow

Resolution
No. 3019

Salary
Schedule

Schedule I $3,375,000
Alternate Bid I S 51,000
Alternate Bid II S 21,000
Alternate Bid III $ 154,000

Total $3,671,000

This contract to be awarded to the E. L. Yeager Construction Company

of Riverside as their bid is the lowest received.
Schedule II - $348,958

This contract to be awarded to Jesse Hubbs and Son of Rialto, as their
bid is the lowest submitted for Schedule II.

Following discussion, on motion of Councilman Sewall, seconded by
Councilman Miller, award of this contract as described above, was

authorized subject to receipt of written approval on both extension

of the State Grant, and confirmation of low bid award by the State

Water Resources Control Board by AYE votes of all present.

On motion of Councilman Miller, seconded by Councilman Sewall, two
grant deeds were accepted and the City Manager authorized to execute

the certificates of acceptance on behalf of the city as follows:

to the City of Redlands from Eva B. Stover for property at 118 East
Redlands Boulevard.

to the City of Redlands from Oral E. and Marjorie E. Norman for pro-
perty at 126 and 128 East Redlands Boulevard.

These two properties are being purchased for future parking facilities

City Manager Merritt presented a recommendation from the Board of
Parking Place Commissioners that an option to purchase the property
presently identified as Parking Lot #3 located on the northeast corner
of Redlands Boulevard and Fifth Street be granted to Life Development
Company in the amount of $100,000 with option to run 12 months at

$100 per month. Council discussed this matter at length, noted that
the appraisal of $100,000 had been made in 1970 and added that it was
broad public knowledge that the property was for sale.

Council discussed this at length. City Attorney Taylor recommended
that a public hearing be held to determine that there is no longer a
public need for this property.

Councilman Miller moved that the Council accept the option with the
reservation that a public hearing be held at the Council meeting on
February 20 to determine that a public use no longer exists. Motion
was seconded by Councilman Sewall and carried by AYE votes of all

present,

City Manager Merritt presented Resolution No. 3019, a resolution of
the City of Redlands amending the salary schedule to increase the
number of full time positions in the Department of Public Works, Shop
Division, from 7 to 8 personnel to include an additional equipment
mechanic. Following discussion, on motion of Councilman Sewall,
seconded by Councilman Miller, Resolution No. 3019 was adopted by AYE

votes of all present.

Mr. Urban Derkum, representing Citrus Village at Cypress and Palm on

Redlands Boulevard, requested a meeting between representatives of







BID TABULATION FOR WASTEWATER TREATMENT
MODIFICATIONS AND ADDITIONS, DECEMBER 20, 1972
Bid Item Bidders
1 2 3 4 5 (3 ~T
Base Bid, Schedule 1 §4,500,000 3,445,000 Ko Bid 3,936,500 3,470,000 3,375,000 3,382,000
Base Bid, Schedule 2 463,900 625,000 348,958 552,600 408,000 424,000 420,000
Deduct Price, (Avard
to oné contractor) 0 100,000 No Bid 100,000 5,000 13,500 0
Total Base Bid
(ScheduTe 1 plus
Schedule 2 Jess
Deduct) 5,063,900 3,970,000 No Bid 4,389,100 3,873,000 3,785,500 3,802,000
Alter. Bid |tem #7-Add 75,000 52,000 No Bid 56,000 51,000 51,000 54,000
Mter. Bid |tem $2-Add 125,000 93,000 No Bid 92,000 92,000 91,000 50,000
Alter, Bid |tem #3-Add 210,000 163,000 No Bid 174,000 166,000 154,000 161,000
Alter, Bid |ten #4-Add 15,000 19,000 11,300 29,500 12,500 15,000 16,000
Mter. Bid Item 45 -

Add or Deduct 29,00 19,39 45,00 28,00 17,00 27.00 21.00
Alter, Bid |tem §6 -

Add or Deduct 27,00 18,00 44,00 27.00 16,00 76,00 20,00
Ater, Bid |tem 47 -

Add or Deduct 39.00 19,70 No Bid 41,00 29,00 40,00 28,00
Alter, Bid |tem §8-Deduct 6,000 5,000 No Bid 7,000 4,000 7,900 5,400
Alter. Bid |tem #9-Deduct 2,500 3,000 No Bid 4,500 3,400 2,700 3,000
Alter. Bid Iten §10-Deduct 4,000 10,000 No Bid 8,900 7,400 7,500 5,700
Alter, Bid |tem #11-Deduct 6,500 4,000 No Bid 9,200 6,400 5,800 1,500
Alter. Bid |tem #12-Deduct 134,000 85,000 No Bid 94,000 70,000 74,000 93,000

0-0-0-0-0-0-0-0-0-0
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